Health & Social Services Committee HSS(2)-01-04(p.5a)

Date: Wednesday 14 January 2004

Venue: Committee Room 3, National Assembly for Wales

Title: Secondary L egislation - Amendments Proposed by Members
Purpose

The proposed regulations are being handled under the protocol for dealing with secondary legidlation
agreed by the Committee on 11 June 2003 (Paper HSY2)-01-03(p2c)), whereby members notify in
advance any gqueries they have or amendments they wish to make to the draft.

The National Assistance (Assessment of Resources) (Amendment) (Wales) Regulations
2004

Amendments Proposed
Amendment 1: Kirsty Williams, Liberal Democrats
Amendment of Principal Regulations - Capital Limits
Regulation 2(2): Delete '£20,500' and insert '£60,000'.
Amendment 2: Plaid Cymru
Amendment of Principal Regulations - Capital Limits
Regulation 2(3): Delete '£20,500' and insert '£25,000'
Amendment 3: Kirsty Williams, Liberal Democrats
Amendment of Principal Regulations - Capital Limits

Regulation 2(3): delete '£20,500" and insert '£60,000'.



The National Assistance (Sums for Personal Requirements) (Wales) Regulations 2004
Small Care Homes for Older People - National Minimum Standards

The Adoption Support Services (Local Authorities) (Wales) Regulations

Community Health Council Regulations

The protocol for handling subordinate legislation agreed by the Committee on 11 June 2003 allows for
discussion of points of clarification and proposed amendments. No amendments or points of clarification
have been tabled for the above regulations therefore they will not be discussed by the Committee.

Members Research & Committee Services January 2004



	Local Disk
	Health & Social Services Committee


